7IGiZ2 143 PM | FW: C-2022-3030149 (VIP Trucking) - Setllement

From: Andrew.Horowiﬁ@obermayer.com. OF F / (' //4 Z Ghé

To: vipmovinginc@aol.com,
Subject: FW: C-2022-3030149 (VIP Trucking) - Settlement
Date: Fri, Jul 8, 2022 11:58 am
Attachments: :
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John,

See below. Please pay the $2200 penalty as Chrts requests below. The memo line of the check should reference
Docket No. C-2022-3030149.

Please also let me know when you have mailed the payment so I can confirm with him.

Thanks.

Andrew

Andrew J. Horowitz, Esquire

Partner

Obermayer Rebmann Maxwell & Hippel LLP

525 William Penn Place, Suite 1710

Pittsburgh, PA 15219

412.288-2461 tel | 412.281. 1530fax ?
andrew.horowitz@obermayer.com | www.obermayer.com

From: Andreoli, Christopher <chandreoli@pa.gov>

Sent: Friday, July 8, 2022 9:30 AM ‘ : .
To: Horowitz, Andrew <Andrew.Horowitz@obermayer.com>

Subject: RE: C-2022-3030149 (VIP Trucking) - Settlement

Mr. Horowitz,
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VIP MOVING
825 Wheatfield Lane
Lebanon, PA 17042
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Rosemary Chiavetta, Secretary
Pennsylvania Public Utility Commission
Commonwealth Keystone Building

400 North Street

Harrisburg, PA 17120
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